


the Intellectual Property Committee of the National Association of Manufacturers (NAM), the
Fellows of the American Intellectual Property Law Association, and the Intellectual Property
Law Section of the State Bar of Michigan. 

Mr. Armitage has served as an Adjunct Professo





Thomas F. Cotter

Thomas F. Cotter is the Briggs and Morgan Professor Law and Solly Robins Distinguished
Research Scholar at the University of Minnesota Law School.  He joined the University of
Minnesota Law School faculty in 2006.  He received his bachelor’s and master’s degrees in
economics from the University of Wisconsin-Madison, and in 1987 graduated magna cum laude
from the University of Wisconsin Law School, where he served as Senior Articles Editor of the
Wisconsin Law Review and was elected to the Order of the Coif.  From 1987-89, he clerked for
the Honorable Lawrence W. Pierce, United States Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit.  He
practiced law at Cravath, Swaine & Moore in New York City from 1988-90, and at Jenner &
Block in Chicago from 1990-94.  From 1994-2005, he taught at the University of Florida
College of Law, where he held a University of Florida Research Foundation Professorship and
directed the school’s Intellectual Property Law Program.  From 2005-06, he was a Professor of
Law at Washington and Lee University School of Law.

Professor Cotter’s principal research and teaching interests are in the fields of domestic and
international intellectual property law, antitrust, and law and economics.  He is the coauthor,
with Roger D. Blair, of Intellectual Property:  Economic and Legal Dimensions of Rights and
Remedies, published by Cambridge University Press in 2005.  He has authored or coauthored
over 30 other scholarly works, including articles in the California Law Review, the Georgetown
Law Journal, the Iowa Law Review, the Minnesota Law Review, the University of Illinois Law
Review, the William & Mary Law Review, the North Carolina Law Review, the Notre Dame Law
Review, and the Tulane Law Review.  

John M. Golden

John Golden is an Assistant Professor at the University of Texas School of Law, where he
teaches patent law and administrative law.  Prior to joining the School of Law, Professor Golden
worked as an associa



He has authored numerous published articles on I



past Chairman of the Medical Industry group of the NVCA.  He received a B.S. degree in
physics from Tufts University, an M.A. from The Fletcher School of Law and Diplomacy, and a
J.D. from Yale Law School.

Anne Layne-Farrar

Dr. Layne-Farrar is a Director with LECG.  She specializes in antitrust matters where the core
issues are at the intersection of intellectual property economics and competition policy.  She
advises clients on competition, regulation, and intellectual property issues across a range of
industries with a focus on high-tech.  Her advisory work for industry leading clients has
included: analyzing RAND licensing practices; analyzing patent filings for market definition;
assessing economic incentives and firm behavior within standard setting organizations;
reviewing the competitive implications of licensing for pharmaceuticals; conducting empirical
research on the costs and benefits of payment instruments within the United States; determining
costs and benefits for legislative proposals covering software security, labor unions, television
ratings, and e-commerce; and assessing the antitrust implications of mergers and acquisitions in
a number of industries.

Dr. Layne-Farrar received her B.A. in economics with honors, summa cum laude, from Indiana
University (Bloomington), her master’s and her Ph.D. in economics from the University of
Chicago.  She has published articles in Antitrust, Global Competition Review, and Regulation
Magazine and has numerous publications in academic journals, including Antitrust Law Journal,
Harvard Journal of Law and Public Policy, and Journal of Competition 000 TD
w Journals.



Dr. Leonard served as a consultant on the issue of immunities and exemptions to the Antitrust
Modernization Commission (“AMC”), and testified before the AMC in December 2005.  He
gave presentations at the 2004 Federal Trade Commission (FTC) and U.S. Department of Justice
Merger Workshop and the 2008 FTC Retail Mergers Workshop.  Dr. Leonard has also made
presentations before the Fair Trade Commission of Japan and the Ministry of Commerce of the
People’s Republic of China.

Dr. Leonard received an Sc.B. in Applied Mathematics-Economics from Brown University and a
Ph.D. in Economics from the Massachusetts Institute of Technology, where he was a National
Science Foundation Graduate Fellow and an Alfred P. Sloan Foundation Fellow.  He was
previously an assistant professor at Columbia University.

Gail F. Levine

Gail F. Levine is an Assistant General Counsel at Verizon Communications Inc., where she
handles a wide array egavira



Prior to his 23 years with PricewaterhouseCoopers, Mr. Levko was a Principal at Arthur Young
(n/k/a Ernst & Young), Plant Controller at Rockwell International (n/k/a Rockwell Automation),
and Car Product Planner at Ford Motor Company.  He was also the Chief Financial Officer of a
retailer during his work with Arthur Young and Rockwell International.  He has in-depth
experience in intellectual property licensing, manufacturing and financial systems, and corporate
development. 

Mr. Levko has published and spoken frequently on intellectual property topics.  He has been
quoted numerous times on Intellectual property and valuation issues in such publications as The
Wall Street Journal, Investors' Business Daily, and les Novelles.  Aron has an M.B.A. in Finance
from the University of Chicago and a B.S.E. in Industrial & Operational Engineering from the
University of dc00 TD
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leading high-technology law firms, Testa, Hurwitz & Thibeault, LLP in Boston.  During his
tenure, he represented venture capital funds, investment banks and public and private technology
corporations on a variety of technology licensing and financial transactions, including $250
million in M&A transactions, $1 billion in public and private financings, and $2 billion in
venture capital fund formations.

Mr. Lord earned his bachelor’s of arts degree, magna cum laude, in business administration and
political science from Concordia College in Moorhead, MN.  He earned his J.D. from Notre
Dame Law School, where he was Propter Honoris Repectum Editor of The Notre Dame Law
Review.

Douglas B. Luftman

Douglas Luftman is Associate General Counsel of Intellectual Property at Palm, Inc. Palm is
headquartered in Sunnyvale, California, the heart of Silicon Valley, and is renowned for its rich
history of innovation in the mobile computing industry, dating back to the original category-
defining Palm Pilot personal digital assistant, and more recently the Treo™ , Centro™ and Pre™
smartphones. Recently, Palm has been publically recognized for its innovation by Fortune
Magazine as a Contender in America’s Most Admired Companies, by Business Week Magazine
as one of the “Top 15 Stocks to Watch” and by innovation-based stock indices, such as Ocean
Tomo 300® (AMEX: OTPAT) and IPX Composite (AMEX: IPXCI).

Mr. Luftman’s areas of focus include strategic intellectual property counseling, patent portfolio
development, intellectual property enforcement and licensing strategy, intellectual property asset
acquisitions, standards development strategy, intellectual property and technology licensing,
open source software management strategy and leveraging information technology systems to
maximize the effectiveness of delivering legal and business services.  Prior to joining Palm, Mr.
Luftman’s roles have included Vice President, General Counsel and Secretary of Caspian
Networks, Inc., West Coast Counsel of CIENA Corporation and Senior Intellectual Property
Group Counsel for Intel Corporation’s Communications Group.  Prior to working in-house, Mr.
Luftman was an attorney at Fenwick & West LLP, Silicon Valley Office.

Mr. Luftman received his J.D. with honors from the0 TD
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Taraneh Maghamé

Taraneh Maghamé is Vice President, Patent Policy and Government Relations Counsel, at
Tessera, Inc. in San Jose, California.  Her responsibilities include advising company
management regarding various Intellectual property and patent-related issues, including issues
relating to patent licensing and litigation.  She is also responsible for Intellectual property due
diligence and strategic Intellectual property counseling relating to development and acquisition
of Intellectual property assets as well as government relations activities relating to intellectual
property law and policy. 

Ms. Maghamé came to Tessera from Hewlett-Packard Company, where she was Senior Counsel
in its Intellectual Property Group.  At Hewlett-Packard, her practice focused on intellectual
property licensing and transactions as well as patent dispute and litigation management.  Before
the merger between Hewlett-Packard and Compaq Computer Corporation, Ms. Maghamé was
responsible for managing all intellectual property litigation for Compaq.  Prior to joining
Compaq, Ms. Maghamé was associated with the law firms of Brobeck, Phleger & Harrison in
Palo Alto and Perkins Coie in Seattle, where she specialized in intellectual property litigation,
licensing, and counseling. 

Ms. Maghamé is a graduate of Georgetown University Law Center and is admitted to practice in
California and Washington State, as well as before the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office.

Steven C. Malin

Steve Malin is Counsel at Sidley Austin, L





Circuit Court Of Appeals.  He was recognized in 2008 as one of the Top 100 California lawyers
by the California Daily Journal and one of the Top 50 attorneys nationally in Intellectual
Property under 45.  He teaches patent litigation at Boalt Hall School of Law.  He is a graduate of
Columbia Law School.

Kevin H. Rhodes

Kevin Rhodes is the President and Chief Intellectual Property Counsel of 3M Innovative
Properties Company in St. Paul, Minnesota, where he is responsible for managing the
intellectual property assets of 3M Company and its worldwide affiliates.

Mr. Rhodes joined 3M in 2001.  Prior to joining 3M, Mr. Rhodes was a partner at Kirkland &
Ellis in Chicago, where he specialized in intellectual property litigation. 

Mr. Rhodes received his J.D., magna cum laude, from Northwestern University.  Mr. Rhodes is a
registered patent attorney, with an undergraduate degree in chemistry from Grinnell College. 

Honorable Sue L. Robinson

Judge Robinson is District Judge for the United States District Court for the District of
Delaware.  She has served on this Court since February 1988 as both a Magistrate and District
Judge.  From June 2000 to June 2007, she served as Chief Judge.  Prior to joining the bench she
was an Assistant United States Attorney for the District of Delaware and an Associate with
Potter Anderson & Corroon.  She was a member of the Judicial Conference of the United States
from 2000-2003.   She received her J.D. from the  University of Pennsylvania School of Law and
her B.A. from the University of Delaware.

David Simon

David Simon is currently the Chief Patent Counsel for Intel Corporation and has been involved
over the last five years in running the intellectual property matters for Intel Corporation.   Prior
to joining Intel in 1996, Mr. Simon was in private practice in Los Angeles for fifteen years,
specializing in intellectual property matters, licensing and High Technology law.  He has a
B.S.E.E. from Massachusetts Institute of Technology and a J.D. from Georgetown University.

John Skenyon

John M. Skenyon is a Principal in Fish & Richardson P.C.’s Boston office.  He joined the firm in
1977, and for over 30 years, he has specialized in patent litigation.  To date, he has been lead
counsel in over 100 intellectual property lawsuits in 24 states, including cases in so-called
“rocket docket” jurisdictions and those known for large numbers of patent trials, such as
Delaware, Texas and California.  He has obtained one of the largest patent jury verdicts ever,
and he has successfully defended clients from damages claims totaling hundreds of millions of
dollars.

Mr. Skenyon is the principal author of a book on patent damages entitled Patent Damages Law



& Practice published by West, and he has written numerous articles and lectured extensively on
patent damages subjects over the years.

Mr. Skenyon is active in numerous organizations, including the AIPLA and the Federal Circuit
Bar Association.  He is past president of the Boston Patent Law Association and is past chairman
of the AI





matter physics, and her J.D. from Columbia Law School.  She is admitted to practice law in New
York, and is registered to practice before the U.S. Patent & Trademark Office.  Ms. Underweiser
is also an adjunct professor at the Benjamin N. Cardozo School of Law where she teaches
technology licensing.

Donald R. Ware

Mr. Ware is a partner in the Boston office of Foley Hoag LLP.  He is a graduate of Yale College
and Harvard Law School.  Mr. Ware chairs the firm’s Intellectual Property Department and
specializes in patent litigation.  He has litigated patent and inventorship disputes for large and


