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home. Third-party payers are encouraged to provide
appropriate incentives to plan members to access the
medical home as the best practice model for pediatric
primary care.

2. Communication: The AAP recommends that RBCs
promptly communicate with the patient’s pediatri-
cian or other primary care physician within 24 hours
of the visit. At a minimum, the following information
should be included: patient’s name, date of birth, at
least 2 additional pieces of identifying information
(eg, parents’ name and/or address), reason for visit,
diagnosis and disposition, findings, laboratory results
(if any), and an indication as to whether any fol-
low-up is needed.

3. Using evidence-based medicine: The AAP recom-
mends that all those providing care to children follow
all AAP clinical guidelines as well as those guidelines
developed by other medical organizations that have
the support and endorsement of the AAP. RBCs
should be required to participate in ongoing quality-
improvement and quality-assurance processes, as is
required of pediatric and other primary care practices.
RBCs must meet all requirements related to quality
assurance and ensure full compliance with state li-
censure requirements for oversight or collaborative
protocols relative to scope of practice.

4. Contagious diseases: By providing medical care to
individuals in a retail-based setting, RBCs must take
the necessary precautions to prevent the spread of
contagious diseases. Although the RBC may have
policies that limit the scope of services, this may not
prevent individuals with contagious diseases from
seeking care at RBCs. This presents a potential public
health hazard to retail staff and customers who may
come in contact with a contagious individual. RBCs

should be subject to and comply with all health care
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