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companies are making potentially anticompetitive acquisitions of nascent or 
potential competitors.”1 But given the Draft Guideline’s silence on core questions 
about what makes an acquisition in these markets “anticompetitive,” it is difficult 
to know how the FTC will evaluate these past mergers, and what lessons it might 
learn from this review or draw upon to police mergers going forward. 

We therefore suggest that the agencies consider revising the Draft Guidelines in 
three specific ways: 
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their partners and new entrants from engaging in what is called disintermediation – 
a disruption of the relationship the dominant platform has with its users.3 

Disintermediation is a key tool by which firms offering a service alongside the 
service offered by a popular platform can compete for the platform’s users, as well 
as for valuable information about those users. A logical competitive step for the 
popular platform, therefore, is to acquire the firm offering that complementary 
service, and then steer its users to the complement it now owns (thus blunting the 
ability of the complementary service provider to engage in disintermediation and 
therefore eliminating its competitive threat). The popular platform, alternatively, 
might acquire the complementary service provider just to shut it down altogether. 

Indeed, that is precisely what Twitter did after buying Vine; it shut it down.4 We 
do not by this observation mean to suggest that Twitter’s acquisition necessarily 
was anticompetitive or that the purpose was to enable Twitter to squelch a potential 
rival, only to note that the Draft Guidelines, as written, imply that this acquisition 
might be beyond their reach. 

The DOJ and FTC should rethink both the name of these Draft Guidelines, as well 
as the explanation of the sorts of acquisitions to which they apply. Otherwise, the 
Final Guidelines risk directing the agencies and court to i
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ON also is seriously concerned that the Draft Guidelines say nothing about how the 
DOJ and FTC will evaluate the competitive dangers of acquisitions in which the 
acquiring firm stands to obtain access to valuable user data – data that it then might 
use to cement its market position and exclude rivals. 

Platforms – whether they provide a search engine, facilitate e-commerce, or offer 
social networking – are funded principally through the sale of display ads and 
sponsored content. It is a truism that the more data these platforms gather about 
their users, the better positioned they are to sell targeted advertising and 
opportunities for sponsored content to businesses that want to reach those users. 
This means that access to the data owned by or available to a potential acquisition 
target can be among the most important justifications for an acquisition that affects 
digital markets. 

As just one example, when Amazon acquired Whole Foods – clearly a vertical 
merger – it didn’t just purchase the right to share the profits (if any) Whole Foods 
makes by selling high-priced groceries. It also acquired access all of the purchasing 
and other data that Whole Foods collects about its upscale customers. At least 
theoretically, Amazon can use that robust data to charge higher prices to 
advertisers (to their possible detriment). It also can stake out an informational 
advantage vis-à-vis other competing e-commerce platforms, making it more 
difficult for the competitors to attract advertisers, to their possible detriment or 
even forcing them to exit. 

Given the overriding importance of user data to the financial health of digital 
platforms funded by advertising, it seems almost antiquated that the Draft 
Guidelines omit any discussion of how the DOJ and FTC will evaluate the 
potential anticompetitive effects of mergers that provide the merged firm with 
increased access to user data. The Final Guidelines should expressly explain how 
the agencies will address this feature of proposed mergers. 
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ON’s concerns about the unchecked power of platforms are not merely theoretical. 
Rather, we believe have that platforms have, in many cases, polluted online 
discourse, targeted vulnerable populations, weaponized online information, 
degraded journalism, contributed to excessive surveillance, damaged mental 
health, promoted addictive behaviors, and undermined democratic processes. 

It therefore is disappointing that the Draft Guidelines – consistent with their 
general silence about how they will be applied in digital markets – say nothing 
about whether or how the agencies will evaluate these sorts of quality harms in 
considering the competitive effects of mergers affecting digital markets. 

Digital markets in particular call out for clarity on this point because the majority 



  

     
          

 
             

         
        

      
       

             
      

       
 

  
 

            
           
        

     
      

 
 

 
        

              
         
         

         
           

   
         

       
       

 

techniques. Of course, given the current economic model of most platforms, all 
users would continue to receive services from the merged firm purportedly for free. 

Yet the Draft Guidelines say nothing about whether the agencies will recognize as 
consumer harm the possibility that a merger could lead to quality harms of this 
sort. Indeed, as other commenters presumably will note, the Draft Guidelines could 
be read actually to preclude the agencies from taking such considerations into 
account. That is because the Draft Guidelines seem to suggest that the agencies 
will require quantification of the harms and benefits of any proposed merger. For 
example, the discussion of unilateral effects in the Draft Guidelines discusses 
simulation models. The Draft Guidelines also discuss evaluation of the potential 
profitability of foreclosure, which also would seem to require detailed 


