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COMPLAINT 

The Federal Trade Commission, having reason to believe that Mega Systems International, Inc., 
a corporation, and Jeffrey Salberg, individually and as an officer of the corporation 
("respondents"), have violated the provisions of the Federal Trade Commission Act, and it 
appearing to the Commission that this proceeding is in the public interest, alleges: 

1. Respondent Mega Systems International, Inc. is an Indiana corporation with its principal 
office or place of business at 2025 East 175th Street, Lansing, Illinois 60438.  

2. Respondent Jeffrey Salberg is an officer of the corporate respondent. Individually or in concert 
with others, he formulates, directs, or controls the policies, acts, or practices of the corporation, 
including the acts or practices alleged in this complaint. His principal office or place of business 
is the same as that of Mega Systems International, Inc.  

3. Respondents have advertised, offered for sale, sold, and distributed products to the public, 
including but not limited to, Eden’s Secret Nature’s Purifying Product, Sable Hair Farming 
System, Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System, Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System, 



and independent radio stations throughout the United States. Kevin Trudeau acts as the host or 
guest in most, but not all, of respondents’ radio and television commercials.  

6. The acts and practices of respondents alleged in this complaint have been in or affecting 
commerce, as "commerce" is defined in Section 4 of the Federal Trade Commission Act.  

Eden’s Secret Nature’s Purifying Product 

7. Respondents have disseminated or have caused to be disseminated advertisements for Eden’s 
Secret Nature’s Purifying Product, including but not necessarily limited to the attached Exhibits 
A and B. These advertisements contain the following statements: 

A. Trudeau: “That cleansing my body has had a dramatic impact on my body and life. I feel 
brighter and more alert for longer periods of time than I have in years, and there’s no question 
that my immune system has dramatically improved.” 

***** 

Wright:“...a body that is cleansed and purified of toxic wast matters, colon waste, fatty arterial 
deposits, the ph balance of the blood’s better, the microflouron of the colon’s better, you’re 
simply enhancing the overall integrity of your body.” 

***** 

Trudeau: "... I honestly believe that people try, they can’t lose weight. And it is really amazing 
because I have friends that I see what they eat, and they try to exercise. They try to, and they still 
can't lose the weight." 

Wright:"That's right." 

Trudeau: "What's the problem here?" 

Wright:"Well, step number one is if you don't cleanse the system out, your body is constantly 
hungry. Why? It is not getting nutrients. It's not getting fed. The colon wall gets lined with some 
sort of a type of, it’s old fecal matter, it’s old gluey plaque like substance. The wall of the colon 
gets compromised in such manner that a lot of the nutrients that you’re eating, the foods that 
you’re eating don’t transfer." 

***** 

Wright:“So what we’re doing is cleaning out the digestive tract, the colon and aiming at cleaning 
and purifying the blood all at the same time. So between the two of these, what we’re initiating, 
Kevin, is a complete biological interwashing. When you assist the body’s own eliminative 
channels, help open them up -- 

Trudeau: “Right.” 



Wright:“The body has an ability to restore itself. The integrity of the cells themselves on a 
cellular level becomes higher because there’s not a lot of junk in there. There’s not a lot of 
plaque in the way. They’re opening up the transfer of nutrients and oxygen so your cells can live 
again.” 

***** 

Trudeau: "And one of the things that everybody said, I asked them, I said what is your weight 
situation, and everyone said they have lost weight." 

Wright: "Right." 

Trudeau: "They're losing pounds." 

Wright: "Right." 

Trudeau: “Now this is obviously, we are not claiming to lose weight with the product, but this is 
cleansing, something is happening here.” 

***** 



insomnia and immune suppression. If you suffer from any or all of these conditions, it’s time to 
listen to your body 



12. Respondents have disseminated or have caused to be disseminated advertisements for Sable 
Hair Farming System, including but not necessarily limited to the attached Exhibit C. This 
advertisement contains the following statements: 

Sabal: “So I found a combination of herbs that, when mixed with cleansers like witch hazels and 
alcohols, can deep clean underneath the surface of the scalp, and clean out all the debris that 
prevents the hair or blocks the hair from reaching the surface.”  

***** 

"And the amazing thing that was happening is that after we cleaned, as we looked at the scalp, 
hair sprouted out."  

***** 

"[T]he hair that sprouts out measures five years, for instance, that it's been growing under the 







"I then met a fellow who did a research report in 1975 at the Oklahoma School for the Blind in 
Muskogee, Oklahoma, V. R. Carter was the Superintendent back then, and he took thirty-five 



21. In truth and in fact, Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will not enable users to achieve 
a photographic memory. In fact, Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System simply consists of 
standard memory techniques. Therefore, the representation set forth in Paragraph 20 was, and is, 
false or misleading. 

22. Through the means described in Paragraph 19, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System is effective in causing adults or 
children with learning disabilities or attention deficit disorder to substantially improve their 
memory. 

23. Through the means described in Paragraph 19, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that they possessed and relied upon a reasonable basis that substantiated the 
representations set forth in Paragraphs 20 and 22, at the time the representations were made. 

24. In truth and in fact, respondents did not possess and rely upon a reasonable basis that 
substantiated the representations set forth in Paragraphs 20 and 22, at the time the representations 
were made. Therefore, the representation set forth in Paragraph 23 was, and is, false or 
misleading. 

25. Through the means described in Paragraph 19, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that: 

A. Scientific studies of Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System on seventh-grade students 
demonstrate that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will substantially improve their 
academic performance and grades.  

B. Scientific studies of Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System on blind children demonstrate 
that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will improve their recall ability to a level of 95% to 
98%. 

C. Scientific studies of Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System on children with IQ’s of fifty to 
sixty demonstrate that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will improve their recall ability 
to a level of almost 100%. 

D. Scientific studies of Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System on children with attention deficit 
disorder demonstrate that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will substantially improve 
their memory.  

26. In truth and in fact: 

A. Scientific studies of Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System on seventh-grade students do not 
demonstrate that Kevin Trudeau’s Mega Memory System will substantially improve their 
academic performance and grades.  









29. In truth and in fact: 

A. Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System does not reduce an individual’s compulsive desire 
to eat, and as such, Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System does not lead to significant weight 
loss. 

B. Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System does not reduce an individual’s compulsive desire 
to eat, and as such, Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System does not lead to significant weight 
loss without the need to diet or exercise. 

C. Dr. Callahan’s Addiction Breaking System does not cure addictions and compulsions, 
including but not limited to, smoking, eating and using alcohol or heroin. Indeed, Dr. Callahan’s 
Addiction Breaking System simply consists of a video tape in which Dr. Callahan demonstrates a 
series of tapping one’s face, chest, and hand, rolling one’s eyes, and humming.  

Therefore, the representations set forth in Paragraph 28 were, and are, false or misleading. 

30. Through the means described in Paragraph 27, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that they possessed and relied upon a reasonable basis that substantiated the 
representations set forth in Paragraph 28, at the time the representations were made. 

31. In truth and in fact, respondents did not possess and rely upon a reasonable basis that 
substantiated the representations set forth in Paragraph 28, at the time the representations were 
made. Therefore, the representation set forth in Paragraph 30 was, and is, false or misleading. 

32. Through the means described in Paragraph 27, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that testimonials with regard to consumers’ use of Dr. Callahan’s Addiction 
Breaking System reflect the typical or ordinary experience of members of the public who use the 
product. 

33. In truth and in fact, testimonials with regard to consumers’ use of Dr. Callahan’s Addiction 
Breaking System do not reflect the typical or ordinary experience of members of the public who 
use the product. Therefore, the representation set forth in Paragraph 32 was, and is, false or 
misleading.  

Jeanie Eller’s Action Reading 

34. Respondents have disseminated or have caused to be disseminated advertisements for Jeanie 
Eller’s Action Reading, including but not necessarily limited to the attached Exhibits J and K. 
These advertisements contain the following statements: 

A. Trudeau: “According to my guest, Jennie Eller, every single person -- if they can see, hear 
and talk -- can learn to read, guaranteed. She also claims that her revolutionary approach to 
teaching reading is easy, quick and works 100 percent of the time.” 

***** 



Eller: “That is the program I took back. We started using it in the Anchorage School District. 
Every child that went through it learned to read.” 

***** 

“And when you go through this program, you start at the beginning and you take every logical 
step right through it. And when you come out, you are a fluent, independent reader. And I’ve put 
my 30 years of teaching credibility on the line. It absolutely is guaranteed to work.” 

***** 

“[B]ut any child that you show them how that code works, you can’t stop them from reading. 
They crack that code. And that code is the key.” 

***** 

Trudeau: “But you’re talking about this secret code. The government says -- you were 
mentioning to me -- that teaches (sic) certain kids just can’t read, and you’re saying that’s 
hogwash.” 

Eller: “It is. It’s absolute hogwash. I’ve been teaching for 30 years and I’ve never had anyone not 
learn to read.” 

Trudeau: “Because I just (sic) watching a show the other day on -- on -- on TV and they were 
saying, this guy’s trying to read. He’s tried -- he tried a phonics program himself. He -- he still 
can’t read. He’s frustrated. He thinks he’s dumb. And they said -- they made the statement, the 
only way he can read is by hard, hard work, and he still may never learn how to read.” 

Eller: “No, that is absolutely not true, and I hope he’s watching this show, because if he’ll get 
this program, I guarantee you he’ll learn to read.” 

***** 

“[I]f you tell them what the words are, they know those words. They speak those words. The 
people that I taught to read on the Oprah Show, as soon as they could decode, decipher the 
newspaper, they knew those words. They were articulate people. They spoke the language. They 
understood the language. They just could not decipher the language.” 

***** 



Easier and quicker for adults to learn, because most already know the vocabulary - they just need 
to learn how to “decode” written words and sentences. 

***** 

1. How can it improve comprehension? 

Even though we’ve heard a lot of words before in conversation, a person who can’t read 
wouldn’t recognize them. Action Reading teaches you how to read words for their meaning. (It’s 
like putting a persons (sic) face to their name, when you have only spoken to them on the 
telephone.) 

***** 

6. Does Jeanie guarantee that she can teach anyone to read? 

Action Reading can teach anyone who can see, hear, think and talk to read... (Exhibit K; 
Telephone Sales Script.) 

35. Through the means described in Paragraph 34, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that Jeanie Eller’s Action Reading is successful in teaching reading 100% of the 
time.  

36. Through the means described in Paragraph 34, respondents have represented, expressly or by 
implication, that they possessed and relied upon a reasonable basis that substantiated the 
representation set forth in Paragraph 35, at the time the representation was made. 

37. In truth and in fact, respondents did not possess and rely upon a reasonable basis that 
substantiated the representation set forth in Paragraph 35, at the time the representation was 



THEREFORE, the Federal Trade Commission this eighth day of June, 1998, has issued this 
complaint against respondents. 

By the Commission.(1) 

Donald S. Clark 
Secretary 

SEAL 

 

Endnotes 

(1) Prior to leaving the Commission, former Commissioner Azcuenaga registered a vote in the affirmative for this 
Complaint. 


